- —r—

STKKINM.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

EXTHAORDINARY

PUBLISHED LY AUTHOL ITY

\
|

ENO- 36 GANGTOK,‘ THUREDAY, APHIL 7, 1977.
Ay
|,f_jm
LEGISLATIVE  DEPARTMENT “ﬁiﬁf’
NOTIFICATION : !
NO.34/11/ 1977
Dated Gan.tok, thec 31st March, 1977.
The following fct of the Sikkir Legislntive Assurbly heving received the x
assent of  the Governor on the 28th day of Merch, 1977 is hereby published for
rencral inforration.
SIKKIM ACT NO.4 OF 1977
SIKKIM SALARINS AND ALLOWANCES ACT, 1977
AN
ACT
to provide for the salarics and allowances of the Ministers, the
speaker, the Deputy Specnker and Morhers of the Lemislative
fssenmbly of  the State of Sikkin.
ic it enncted by the Lepislature of Sikkir in the Twonty-
cipht Year of thc Republic of Indin as follows:-
Short title and . -
Corroncercent. 1. (1) This fct may be called thu Sikkim Salarics and Allow- A

Definitions.

ances Act, 1977,

(2) The provisions of this “ict shall core into force at
once except the provisions of Section 3 which shall
corce and shall always bte deocmed to have come into fo—
rce with effect fror the 1st day of April, 1978,

2. In this Aet, unless there 1s anything renurnant in the
- subject or context,

(a) 'Aesembly' neans th. Lorislative isserbly of the Stato
of Sikkir.

(b) 'Chief Minister!, 'Ministor!, 'Minister of State! ard
'Deputy Minister'! shall mean respectively tho Chicf
Ministe., a Minister, a Minister of State or a Deputy
Ministor of the State of Sikkir.

(¢) ‘'Comrittee’' renns a Corritter of the Asscrhly and
ineludes a Corrittec appointed by the State Govern: ent.

(d) 'Deputy Speaker' ponns Daputy Speaker of the hsserbly.

Contd.,.. 2/-



Salaries and
Lllowarces.

Residence.

7

D

o B

T

“Be

(C) iParily! in rclation tc versen reans the wife or the

husl=nd, 28 the case nay te, and minor children of such -

person and also tho parents and adult children of such
T ard adult children arc wholly dependent on such

| pGI‘S’QlJ - )

(£) 'Furnichod! voans  provided with furniture and fittines on
such grale and within such lirdits as ray be prescribed.

) ‘paintenance! in relotion to a residence shall inelude )
repairs, ctructural addition ard alternations and provision
of conncctions four water nnd clectricity and payrent of I
runicinal rates nd taxes and othcr charpes in respect
oL the residence. '

(h) 'rerber' means A merber of the Assembly other than the
Chief Minister, a Minister of State , a Deputy Minister,
the Spenker i oo Depusy Speakor and shall dnclude a
remeeT acting ac Speaker in the absance of the Spenker
and the Yeputy Spenaker.

(i) 'Mont:: ! shall muan a month reckoned accordin; to the
English Calender.

(§) 'Preceribed’ meanz preseribed by rulas made under
this fAct.

(k) 'Rent' includes charres for clectricity and water.

k) 'Residensc' Iacluden il rardgs  , fAarden, lawn,
guarters for the stalf, servants, sccurity porsonncl
or pusrds Aand ruest housce within the compound of the
residence.

(r) 'Session' reans the whol- period fror the tire when

the Asgerbly roots to the timg wher it is prororucd,
(n) 'Speaker' menns the Spenker oi the  Asserbly and
shall include a rermber or the Assembly appointed Ly the
Governor to perform the duties of the Speaker when the
poste of the Spealer and the Deputy Speaker arc vacant,

(1) There shall be paid to the Chicf Minister, the Minister,
the Minister of Stnte, the Deputy Minister, the
Speaker and the Deouty Speaker such’monthly salarjes
as speeified in the Scheaule. |

(2) Therc shall be poid to the Chief Minister, the Minister
and tho Speaker sueh wontinly swrptuary 21lowances as
speeified ir the Schedule. ,

(3) Thefe shall be prsid to every merber of the Assorbly a
salary at the rate of elpght hurdred rupees per month

and also a consolidated allowance at the rate of two
hundred rupecs  per month for his travelling and other
expenses includin, the cexpenses neccessary for attending ﬂ
the reetings of the Asserbly or a Comnittec,

.(1) The Chief Ministcr, the Minister, thc Minleter of £xx

State,the Depucy Minister, the Speaker and the Deputy
Speaker shall bg ertitled without payment of rent to

use of a furnished residence in Gangtok throughout the/y)
terr of his office aAnd for a month after he ceases to
hold such offica.

contd ....3/



o~ : ]
" o
—-Iq—-
(2) Vher: aﬁy ol tnet porsons rentioned in sub-section (1), is
nol provide: with any rcsidence urder subsecticn (1), he x
shall be péd an allow-nce at the rate of mxnxfﬂzgx fovF
hundred rumees per month so lonr Aas he is not provided with
such rceideric. . ’
(3)  All cxpexcitire for majntenarce and furnishing 6f any
residen:e provided under sub-section 1) shall be bornc by
the Govarnmre-ns. e
Every ramber shall Le cntitled to such residential accorro- AT
datiir 2s say be prescribed at the place of the sittin, of %% =il
the ~sevbly during the session or a reetdrs of a Corvittee,
5. (1) The nief Miniestor, the Minister, the Minister of State, the
Dep+/ Speaker shall be provided with free vehicle and driver .
anc All exrenses for the salaries and allowances of thc driver, @hﬁﬁ
cct of fuel, upto such lirit ae may be prescrited, expenditurd
¢ Maintenance and reprirs of  the vehicles shall re lorne by
e Governmrant.
(2) ‘here eny of the persons rentioned in sub-scetion (1) 1a
not provided with the facilities of conveyance as specified
thercin, he shall be paid a conveyance allowance at the ratc
of Ffour hundred rupecs pur ronth and siinll in additicn be
provided with a driver under the erpleyrent of the Governrent.
Every member shall e provided with a free non-transferable
first class pass for travelling by railway fror and to any
place in India for a distance of not exceedin,, five thiusand
kiloretres in the arerepate in any firancial year and also a
pass for travelling within the State of
wned, controlled or

Conveyancs -

“n
~—

free non-tiransierahble
Sikkin by any transport service vehicle o
nanaged by the Governmont.

The Chief Minister, thc Minister, the Minister of State, thc
the Deputy Minister, the Speaker, the Duputy Speaker and the
rerters abonrs with thedr farily shall be entitled to free
redical attendance and treatrent in any of the Government
hospitals of the State and nlso such other medjical facili-

ties as may be prescribed.

Mcdieal faeiliddies (4)

Travelli:~ /ilkowance.
' (7. The Chief Minister, the Minister , the Minister.of State,

the Deputy Minister, the Speaker, the Deputy Speaker
and the members shall be entitled to travelling
ellowancc while on tour on public business st such rates el
and subject to such conditions as may bLe prescribed., b
Power Lo rake rules
8. The State Government ray irake rules for carrying out
the p urposes of this Act an., in particular for any
of the ratters required to b prescribed under any of the

f forepgoin,, provisions of this jct.

Lepeal and savinge.9.(1)1T 411 laws including rules, regulations, orders, noti-
fications,circulars or other provisions in respect of any
muatter governed by thie Act, rade or issued prior to

the cornencerent of this 4ct, shall cease and shall
alvays bc-deered to have ceased to have any force or effect
on and fror such comrcneorent.

(2) Notwithstanding anythine contained in sub—section(l),
all elnims under any of the provisiane rentioned in sub-
section (1) relatin. to the period prior to the comrence-
ment of this Act, and remeining: unpadd or unad justed on
the date of the comrencerent of this Act shdll o phid
or ndjusted, as the case ray be under the said provisionw
s Af this  Act had  not cone into forde, . I



'J“
v A, N‘!h
(3) Any order i::sued, clains pald, payments made or i f
} any obher sction taken before the commencement of thjsa J;
’ Acs in respect of salzries and allowances includin v b
’ advance paymrent thereof =snda all other matters governed‘ &
| Ly this Act shall be deemed to have been validly
J ' isstned, paid, wade or taken duly and properly anc
( under proper leral authority.
‘ 4
SCHELULE i
(L Section 3(i) and Section 3(2% )
Designation Salary Sumptuary Allowance
1. Chief Minister  Rs.z,250/- Ls.450/- ‘ﬁg
2. Spenker s.2,000/- its,200/- i
5. Minister ks.1,.50/- 105,225/
4. Deputy Speaker Is.1,600/- nil
5. Minister of State Rs.1,600/- Nil
' 6. Deputy Minister is.1,200/~ Nil

BY OLDElL OF TH® GOVELKOf
B.lt.Pradhan,
Sueretary to the Government
of Silkiy

F 97/LL/77



SIKKIM

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

EXTRA ORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 44 Gangtok, Monday, April 3, 1978

LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION
No. 10/LL/78

Dated Gangtok, the 3" April, 1978

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of Government on the
31* day of March, 1978 is hereby published for general information

SIKKIM ACT NO. 10 OF 1978
SIKKIM SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1978
AN
ACT
To amend the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977;
WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977, in the
manner hereinafter appearing:
Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Sikkim in the Twenty-ninth Year of the
republic of India as follows:-

Short title 1. This Act may be called the Section 3 of Sikkim Salaries and Allowances (Amendment)
Act, 1978.

Amendments 2. (1) In sub-section (3) of Section 3 of Sikkim Salaries and Allowance Act 1977, the words

“or a Committee” shall be and shall always be deemed to have been deleted.

(2) Section 7 of Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977, shall be and shall always be
deemed to have been numbered as sub-section (1) there of and after sub-section (1) so
numbered the following shall be and shall always be deemed to have been added as
sub-section (2),

*“(2) The embers shall be entitled to such traveling allowances and facilities at such

rates and subject to such conditions as may be prescribed, for attending the meeting of
a Committee”

By Order of the Governor,

B.R. PRADHAN,
Secretary 1o the Government of Sikkim
Law and Legislative Department
F. 16 (11) LL/77



SIKKIM
L

o
GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 36 Gangtok, Friday, April 11, 1980

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION
No. 6/LL/80.
Dated Gangtok, the 5th April, 1980,

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of the Governor
on the 5th day of April, 1980, is hereby published for general information.

SIKKIM ACT NO. 6 OF 1980.
THE SIKKIM SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1980.

AN
ACT

further and the Sikkim salaries and Allowances Act, 1977 (4 of 1977).

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act,
1977 (4 of 1977) in the manner hereinafter appearing:

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Thirty-first year of the
Republic of India as follows:—

l. (I)  This Act may be called the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances (Amendment)  Short title and

Act, 1980. commencement
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 25th day of October,
1979.

2. In the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977 (4 of 1977) — Amendment of
section 1, Section
3and Schedule,

(a) in sub-section (1) of section 1, for the words "Sikkim

Salaries and Allowances Act", the words "Sikkim Ministers,
Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly
(Salaries and Allowances) Act" shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-section (2) of section 3 for the words "and the Speaker"
the words" ",the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker" shall be subs-
tituted.

c) in the Schedule for entry 4, the following shall be substituted:—'

“4. Deputy Speaker Rs. 1,750/- Rs.225/-"

By Order of the Governor,

R. K, GUPTA,
Secretary to the Government of Sikkim,
Law & Legislative Department,
Government of Sikkim,
F. No. 16(60)LL/78.

PRINTED AT THE SIKKTM GOVERNMENT PRESS



*

STKKIM

GOVERNMENT

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBL™HED BY AUTHORITY

Mo. 77 Gangtok, Friday, Scptember 19, 1930

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
No. 9/1.L/80.
Dated Gangtok, the 18th September, 1980.

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of
the Governor on the 16th day of September, 1980, is hereby published for general information.

SIKKIM ACT NO. 10 OF 1980

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER
AND MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 1980.

AN
ACT

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy-Speaker and Mem-
bers of th: Legisle ive Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (4 of
1977).

ne it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Thirty-first year of
the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy- Short title and
Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and commencement,
Allowances) Amendment Act, 1980.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the st day of August,

1980. o
2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy-Speaker and Members of Amendment of
the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977— section 3 and g,

(a) in sub-section (3) of scction 3 for the words “two hundred rupees”
the words “three hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-section (3) of section 5 for the words “five thousand kilo-
metres” the words “eight thousand kilometres” shall be substituted,

Py Order of the Governor,
B. R, PRADHAN,

bcc'rctary lc|> the Government of Sikkim,
DU T SRR [N A s NS Y



GOVERNMENT

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AU THORIT Y

No.106 Gangtok Monday, September 15, 1986
GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
LAW DEPARTMENT
GANGTOK
NOTIFICATION
No. 10/LD/86

Dated the 8th September, 1986,

The followin

g Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of
the Governor on the

6th day of September, 1986 is hereby published for general information :—

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND
MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 1986.

(ACT NO. 10 OF 1986)

AN
ACT

further amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker

and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act,
1977.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Sikkim in the Thirty-
seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1.(1)  This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy

Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allow
ances)Amendment Act, 1986.

Short title and
commencements

(2) It shall come into force on the Ist day of September, 1986.

2, In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinafter
referred to as the 'said Act’), in section 3, in sub-section (3),-

Amendment of
section 3.

(a) For the words "eight hundred fupees per month" the words "one
thousand rupees per month", and

(b) For the words "three hundred rupees per month” the words "fiye
hundred rupees per month” shall pe substituted.
Shall be substituted.



2

3. In the said Act, for the existing Schedule, the following Schedule shall be

substituted, namely :—

"SCHEDULE

sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 3

SLNo.  Designation

Salary Sumptuary Allowance
1. Chief Minister Rs. 3,800/- Rs. 700/-
2. Speaker Rs, 3,500/- Rs. 500/-
3. Minister Rs. 3,000/- Rs..500/-
4. Deputy Speaker Rs. 3,000/- Rs. 500/-
5. Minister of State Rs. 2,500/- Rs. 300/-
6. Deputy Minister Rs. 2,200/- Rs. 250/-

B.R. PRADHAN,
Secretary to the Govt, of Sikkim
Law Department,.
(F.No.(11)LD/1977/86.)

RPINTED AT THE SIKKIM GOVERNMENT PRESS GANGTOK.



SIKKIM

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Gangtok, Tuesday, September 17, 1991 No. 144

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
LAW DEPARTMENT
GANGTOK

No. 8/D/1991 Dated Gangtok, the 17th September, 1991.

NOTIFICATION

The followin

g Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the
the Governor on 1

assent of
7th day of September, 1991, is hereby published for general info

rmation:-

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND
MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT, ACT, 1991.
(ACT NO. 5 OF 1991)
AN
ACT
further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker,
Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and All
Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Si
Year of the Republic of India as follows:-
1, (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy
Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and

Allowances) Amendment Act, 199].

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 1st

day of July, 1991,

In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act), in section 3 for sub-section (3, the
following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

(€))] There shall be paid to every member of the Assembly—

(a) asalary at the rate of one thousand rupees per month;

(b) aconsolidated allowance at the rate of five hundred rupees per
month for his travelling and other expenses necessary for at-
tending the meetings of the Assembly; and

(c) a constituency allowance of one thousand rupees per month.”

3. In the principal Act, after section 7, the following new section shall be
inserted, namely:-
7TA. (1) Every Member shall be provided with a telephone
if located within and around Gangtok for the term
all expenses for initial deposit, installation, rental
call charges and local charges upto such limit as

from time to time by the Government shall be bo
Government.

Deputy Speaker and
owances) Act, 1977,
kkim in the Forty-second

at his residence
of his office and
and official trunk
may be specified
rne by the



2

(2) In the case of a Member already having a telephone at his residence
if located within and around Gangtok the rental and official trunk
call charges and local charges upto such limit as may be specified

from time to time by the Government shall be borne by the Govern-
ment for the term of his office".

By Order of the Governor

B.R. Pradhan,
Secretary to the Government of Sikkim
Law Department.
(F.No. 16(1 1)/LD/1977/91)

PRINTED AT THE SIKKIM GOVT. PRESS, GANGTOK



SIKKIM

GOVERNMENT GAZEITE

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLLSHED BY AUTHORITY

Gangtok, Friday, 25th September, 1998 No. 215
GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
LAW DEPARTMENT
GANGTOK
No.4/LD/98 Dated the 25th September, 1998
NOTIFICATION

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of the Governor on the
20th day of September, 1998 is hereby published for general information:

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER
AND MEMBERS OF THE SIKKIM LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES
AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 1998.

(ACT NO.4 OF 1998-)
AN
ACT

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker
and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Forty-ninth Yearof the Republic
of India as follows:

Short title and l. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy
commenceme Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries
nl. and Allowances) Amendment Act, 1998,

(2) It shall come into force on the Ist day of April, 1998.

2.In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly
(Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977(hereinafler referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, in
sub-section (3),
(i) in clause (ﬂ), for the words "one thousand" the words "four thousand"
shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (b), for the words "five hundred" the words "fifteen hundred"
shall be substituted; and



2

3 In the principal Act, for the existing Schedule, the following

2.
Schedule shall be substituted namely:

SCHEDULE
(see sub-section (1) and (2) of section 3)

SI. No. Designation Salary
] Chief Minister Rs. 9500/
2 Speaker Rs. 8500/
3 Minister Rs. 7500
4 Deputy Speaker Rs. 7500
5 Minister of State Rs. 6500/
6 Deputy Minister Rs. 5500/

By order of the Governor.

T .D. Rinzing,

Sumptuary Allowance

Rs. 5000/
Rs. 4500/
Rs. 4000/
Rs. 4000/
Rs. 3000/
Rs. 2500/

Legal Remembrancer and Secretary
Law to the Govt. of Sikkim
. F. No. 16(11))LD/1977



SIKKIM

GOVERNMENT . & GAZETTE
(EXTRAORDINARY)
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
Gangtok , Saturday 16"  December 2000 No . 435

LAW DEPARTMENT
GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM

GANGTOK — 737101
No. 19/LD Dated 16.12.2000
NOTIFICATION
The following act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of the
Governor on 13" day of December , 2000 is hereby published for general information.
THE SIKKIM MINISTERS , SPEAKER , DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF THE
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2000
(ACT. NO. 19 OF 2000)
AN
ACT
Further to amend the Sikkim Ministers , Speakers , deputy Speaker and Members of the
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977.

Be it enacted byt the Legislature of Sikkim in the Fifty —first year of the Republic of India as

follows:-
Short title and 1. (i) This aCt may be called the Sikkim Ministers , Speaker, deputy
Commencement speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and
Allowances) Amendment Act, 2000.
(ii) It shall come into force at once.

Amendment of 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speakers , Deputy Speaker and Members of
section 7A the Legislative Assembly (salaries and Allowances ) Act, 1977, in
section 7A , sub- sectuib (1) and (2), the words “if located within and

around Gangtok” shallbe omitted.
By Order of the Governor,

T.D.Rinzing
Secretary to the Governemnt of Sikkim
Law Department
F.No. 16(82)/LD/2000



SIKKIM

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
Gangtok Monday, 12" October, 2001 No 411
GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
LAW DEPARTMENT
NO.09/LD/2001 dated 12" November.2001
NOTIFICATION

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislation Assembly having received the assent of the Governor on 5th day of
November, 2001 is hereby published for general information:-

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2001
ACT NO.8 OF 2001
AN

ACT

Further to amend the Sikkim ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and members of the

Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances )Act, 1977.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Fifty-Second Year of the Republic of India as folloes:-

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called-the Sikkim Ministers. Speaker, Deputy
Commencement. Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries
and Allowances)

(2) it Shall be deemed to have come into force on the | st day of April,2001

Amendment of 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the

Section 3. Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the
principal Act), in Section 3, in sub-section (3),
(i) in clause (a), for the words “four thousand", the word “eight thousand” shall be substituted:

(ii)in clause(b), for the words “fifteen hunhred", the word “three thousand” shall be  substituted:
and



(iii)in clause(c)for the words ‘two thousand "the words four thousand shall be substitute_d.
Amendment of schedule 3.In the principal Act for the existing schedule the following schedule shall be substituted

namely:-
SCHEDULE
(See sub-section(1)and (2)of section 3)
Sl.  Designation Salary Sumptuary Allowance
No
1. Chief Minister Rs.19,000/- Rs.10,000/-
2. Speaker Rs.17,000/- Rs.9,000/-
3. Minister Rs.15,000/- Rs.8,000/-
4. Deputy Speaker Rs.15,000/- Rs.8,000/-
5. Minister of State Rs.13,000/- Rs.6,000/-
6. Deputy Minister Rs.11,000/- Rs.5,000/-
BY Order,
T.D.RINZING,

Secretary to the Govt. of SIKKIM,
Law Department.
F.No.16(82)LD/2001.



SIKKIM

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

_ PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
Gangtok Wednesday 24th February, 2010 No. 61

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
LAW DEPARTMENT
GANGTOK

No. 11//LD/P/2010 Date: 24.2.2010

NOTIFICATION

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, CEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF SIKKIM
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2009

(ACT NO. 11 OF 2009)
AN
ACT

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Sikkim
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977,

Beit enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixtieth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

Short title and (2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the first day of June,
commencement. 2009.
2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of
Sikkim Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977, in
section 4:-

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “three thousand”, the words “fourteen
thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;
Amendment of (i) in sub-section (4), after the words “entitled to” and before the word
section 4. “such”, the words “house rent allowance of rupees nine thousand
four hundred per month or" shall be inserted.

By Order.

R.K. PURKAYASTHA (SSJS)
Legal Remembrancer-cum- Secretary
Law Department

File No. 16 (82)/LD/P/2010
S.G.P.G.-61/Gazette/ 100 Cps./24.02.2010




SIKKIV
GOVERNMENT w2

GAZETTE

&
EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Gangtok Friday 26th March, 2010 No. 98

LAW DEPARTMENT
GOVERNMNET OF SIKKIM
GANGTOK
No.3/LD/P/2010 Dated: 25/03/2010.
NOTIFICATION .

The following Act passed by the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received the assent
of the Governor on 4™ day of March, 2010 is hereby published for general information:-

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE
ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2010

(ACTNO. 3 OF 2010)
AN
ACT

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative
Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-first year of the Republic of India as
follows:-
Short title and 1. (1)  This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy
commencement Speaker and Members of Legislative Assembly (Salaries and
Allowances) Amendment Act, 2010.

(2) Itshall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official

Gazette.
Amendment of 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of
section 3 Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinafter

referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, in sub-section (3),-
(i)  inclause (a), for the words "eight thousand”, the'words "ten
thousand"” shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (b), for the words “three thousand”, the words “fifteen
thousand"” shall be substituted;



Amendment of
Schedule

Sl

N =2
°

(i) in clause (c), for the words "four thousand”, the words “fifteen
thousand” shall be substituted.

In the principal Act, for the existing Schedule, the following Schedule

shall be substituted, namely:-

“"SCHEDULE
(See sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 3)

Designation Salary
Chief Minister  Rs. 50,000/-
Speaker Rs. 45,000/-
Minister Rs. 40,000/

Deputy Speaker Rs. 40,000/

Sumptuary Allowance

Rs. 30,000/
Rs. 25,000/
Rs. 20,000/
Rs. 20,000/-".

R.K. Purkayastha, SSJS
L.R.-cum-Secretary, Law
Publication File No. 16 (82)/LD/2010

S.G.P.G. - 98/ Gazette/ 100 Cps./ 26.03.2010



GAZETTE

EXTRAORDINARY

YTk - PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
—— | (Gangtok Monday 27" September, 2010 No. 529
‘ LAW DEPARTMENT '
& GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
9.2010 F GANGTOK
1 No. 17/LD/P/2010 Dated: 25.09.2010
stnoron NOTIFICATION

The following Act passed by the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received the assent of the

.;f'i.ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2010.

(ACTNO. 17 OF2010)
AN
ACT

ndiaas
':_: Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-first Year of the Republic of India as follows:-
ent ‘ o )
£ Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers of Legislative Assembly
B commencement (Salaries and Allowances) Amendment Act, 2010,
rasthe f . - (2) t shall come into force on the daie of its publication in the Official Gazette. .
y:- -
gaming * Amendment of 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative
sial  F Schedule Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977, in the Schedule, after serial
‘B ' no. 4 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial no. and the entries
i shall be inserted, namely :-
) the e

“5 Minlster of State Rs.35,000/- Rs,15,000/-".

R.K. Purkayastha, SSJS
L.R-cum-Secretary,
Law & Parllamentary Affalrs Department.

File No. 16 (82) LD/P/2010
73



SIKKIM

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
Gangtok Monday 14th  November, 2011 No.591

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
LAW DEPARTMENT
GANGTOK

No. 09/LD/2011 Date: 16/09/2011
NOTIFICATION

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received the assent of the Governor
on the 3rd day of September, 2011 is hereby published for general information:-

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE
ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2011.

(Act No. 9 of 2011)
An
Act

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative
Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-second Year of the Republic of India as
follows:- _
Short title 1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and
and Members of Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Amendment
commencement Act, 2011.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 27" day of September, 2010.

Amendment 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative

of Schedule Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977, in the Schedule, after serial no. 5
and the entries relating thereto, the following serial no. and the entries shall be
inserted, namely :-

."6 Deputy Minister of State  Rs. 33,000/ Rs.15, 000/-".

By Order

R.K. PURKAYASTHA (SSJS)
LEGAL REMEMBRANCER-CUM-SECRETARY,
LAW DEPARTMENT
File No. 16 (82)/LD/2005

S.G.P.G. - 591/ Gazette /30Nos./Dt:- 14.11.2011.



- SIKKIM

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Gangtok Thursday 11" October, 2012 No.,515

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
LAW DEPARTMENT
GANGTOK

No. 11/LD/P/2G12 Dated: 08.10.2012.

NOTIFICATION

The following Act passed by the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received the assent
of the Governor on 25™ day of September, 2012 is hersby published for general information:-

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS
OF LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES)
AMENDMENT ACT, 2012 (ACT NO. 11 OF 2012)

AN
ACT

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative
Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

s

Short title and 1. }1) This Act may be called lhe Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker
commencement and Members of Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances)
Amendment Act, 2012.

(2) It shall corge into force on the date of its publication in the Official *

Gazette.
Amendment of 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of
section3 Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinalter

referred to as the principal Act), in clause (a) of sub-section (3) of section

3, for the words "ten thousand”, the words “twenly five thousand” shall be
substituted.



Amendment 3. In the principal Act, for the existing Sclizdule, the folrowing Sche ! shay

of Schedule be substituted, namely:-
“SCHEDULE

(See sub section (1) and (2) of sution 3)
SI. No. Designation Salaiy SumptucryAllowance
1. Chief Minister Rs. 50,000/ Rs. 45,0720/-
2. Speaker Rs. 45,000/- 8. - k-
3. Minister Rs. 0,00 /- " He, 56 000r-
4. Deputy Speaker Rs. 40,000/- Rs. 35,000/
5. Minister of State Rs. 35,000/- Rs. 30,000-
6. Deputy Minister Rs. 33,000/ Fes. 30, Clur<",

R.K Purkayaswia (SSJS)
L.R-cum=Secretary,
.Law Department.

'$.G.P.G. - 615/ Gozette /30Nos./Dl:- 11,10.2012



SIKKIWV

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
0
EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
Gangtok Thursday 14" June, 2018 o No. 318

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM
LAW DEPARTMENT
GANGTOK

No. 07/LD/18 Date: 14.06.2018

NOTIFICATION
The following Act passed by the Sikki

assent of the Governor on 11* day of J
information:-

m Legislative Assembly and having received
une, 2018 is hereby published for general

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2018

(ACT NO. 07 OF 2018)
AN
ACT

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India
as follows:-

Short title and 1. (1} This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy
commencement Speaker and Members of Legislative Assembly (Salaries and
Allowances) Amendment Act, 2018,
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on 1% day of April,
2018,
Amendment of 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of
Section 3 Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977
(hereinafter referred to as the "Principal Act", in section 3, in sub-
section (3),-

(i) in clause (a), for the words "twenty five thousand", the words
“ninety thousand" shall be substituted:



Amendment of

(i) in clause (b) for the words “fifteen thousand”, the words "thirty
thousand" shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (c), for the words “fiteen thousand”, the words “thirty
thousand" shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Act, for the existing Schedule, the following Schedule

Schedule shall be substituted, namely:-
“SCHEDULE
(See sub-section (1) and (2) of section 3)
Sl. | Designation Salary Sumptuary Allowance
No. )
1. | Chief Minister Rs. 1,60,000/- Rs. 1,10,000/-
2. | Speaker Rs. 1,40,000/- Rs. 90,000/
3. | Minister Rs. 1,20,000/- Rs. 80,000/
4, | Deputy Speaker Rs. 1,20,000/- Rs. 80,000/
5. | Minisier of State Rs. 1,00,000/- Rs. 70,000/-
6. | Deputy Minister of State Rs. 95,000/ Rs.  65,000/-".

Amendment of
section 4

Amendment of
section &

4. In the Principal Act, in section 4,-

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “fourteen thousand five
hundred”. the words “"eighteen thousand" shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (4), for the words “nine thousand four hundred",
the words “thirteen thousand five hundred" shall be substituted
and the words “during the session or a meeting of committee”
appearing after the word “Assembly”, shall be omitted.

5. In the Principal Act, in section 5, in sub-section (1), for the words
"the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker", the words “the Speaker, the
Deputy Speaker and Members" shall be substituted.

Jagat B. Ral (SSJS)
L.R-cum-Secretary
Law Secretary

S.G.P.G. - 318/ Com, 2/Gazette /100 Nos./ Dt.- 14.06.2018,

P
/£ D,
e &

-’




{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }

