
SIK K I M 

GAZ E T TE GOVER NM ENT 

EXTACN DINARY 

PUILISH ED Y AUTH OI: ITY 

No. 36 GANGTOK, TH URSDAY, ÁPRIL 7, 1977. 

LFGIS LATIVE DEPARTMENT 
NOTIFIC ATION 

NO. 4/11/ 1977 

Dated Gan.,tok, the 31st March, 1977 
The following hct of the Sikkir. Lorislntive Asscnbly havin? received the 

assent of the Governor on the 28th day of March, 1977 is hereby publi shod for 

rencral inforration. 

SIKKIM ACT NO.4 OF 1977 

STKKIM SALAIES AND ALLOW ANC ES ACT, 1977 

AN 
ACT 

to providc for the sAlarics and allowances of the Ministers, the 
speakor, the Deputy Sponker and Morhers of tho Lerisl:tive 
isscnb1y of tho ftnte of Sikkir 

Lo it enncted by the Lerislnturc of Sikkir in the Tvnty ight Year of the Rapublic of Indin as follovs: 
Short title and 

(1) This Act may he called thu Sikkim Salarics end Allow-
ances Act, 1977. 

Cor c.rc cr cnt 1 

(2) The provisi ons of this ict shnll coro into force at 
onee exeept the provi si ons of Soction 3 which shall 
core and shall always te deorod to have corie into fo-
rce with effcct fror tha 1st dny of April, 1976. 

In this Act, unlc ss there is arything renurnant in the 
subjectt or context, 

(a) 

Definitions. 2. 

Assembly' Iieans thi. Lo:i slative isser:bly of the Stato 
of Sikkir. 

Chief Minister', 'Ministor, 'Minister of State' and (b) 
Deputy Minister' shnll, mean respoc tivoly thu Chicf 
Ministe., a Minieter, a Miristor of State or a Deuty Ministor of th» State of Sikkir. 

(c) Coittce' renns a Corr ittco of thc isserbly and includes a Conrittoc ppoi ntod by thc Statç Govern:: ent. (a)'Do puty Speakcr' renns Deputy Spcakcr ot tho hsserbly. 

Contd.... 2/-



(c)Fari ly' in rolati on te nerson reans the vife or tha 
huslnd, 1s tho e18 y te, and minor children of such 
person ard akso th: parents nd adult childron of suchn 

nd ndult children arc holly dependent on such 
pe1'sôl1 . 

'Furniched' roans provided with furniture and fittings on 

sueh scal: and wi. thin such li:its as ray he prescribed. 

(c'rnintenance' in rel tion to a residonca shall include 
ropairs, structurnl acdi.tion ard nlternations and provis:on 
of ccnncc tions fur watcr nd olectrici ty and 
runicipal rateE ni taxos nnd othur charres in respect 
oi thc residence. 

pyrent of 

(h) 'ncr.bor' iu AnE a ncr bir of the Asscnbly other than thc 
Chicf Minister, a iinister of Stat.e, a Deputy MinistCT, 
the Spenker ind u Dcpry Spcakor and shall inc lude a 
Cmaor actin. ac Spcaker in the ahsonce of the Spenker 
and tho "eputy Sponkor 

() Mont!: shall s4n a month reckonad accordin to the 
English Calondecr. 

j'Proscribed Oanz prescribod By rules radc under 
this Act. 

(k) 'kent' includes charres for clectricity and wnter. 

()'Ros:denec ' iniduèu i PrlgG ,arden, lnwn, 
quartcrs for thc staff, sorvant s, sccurity prrsonncl 
or puards Hnd ruest house within the conpound of tho 

Tesidencc. 
()'Session' cans the whol p+riod fror: tho tiro whon 

tho AssoIrbly ricnts to the tirG whher. it is pror ofrucd, 

(n) Spcalker' nenns the Cpenker oi the Asserbly and 
shall ine lude a ren ber or the Assa.bly appoi nt od y the 
Governor to perfor: the duties of the Spoakar whon tho 

posts of the Sponker and the Deputy Speaker aro vacant. 

Salaries and 3. (1) Tere shnll be p:id to tho Chiuf Minis ter, the Mi ni ster, 

Allovane es. the the Minister of Stato, thc Deputy Ministar, 

Spuakar and the Denuty Spenker such "ronth ly salari os 

as specified in the Scheaule. 

(2) Thero shall bu pid to the Chiaf Minister, the Mini ster 
and tho Spenkur sLci :ontiily sueptuary allowancos as 

spocificd in the Schedule. 

(3) Thefe shall be paid to every rerber of the Assarby a 
at the rete of eirht hurdred rupees per nonth 

of two 
salary 
and alsoa consolidated allowance at the rate 
hundrad rupees par month for his trve l1 in;, and other 
expensas includin,, the cxpeuses necess ary for attendin 
tho irootings of the Assorbly or a Cor:i tteo. 

Residence. 4.(1) The Chief kini stor, the Mándster, the Nindeter of 2x 
Stte, the Depusy Mänister, tho Speaker and the Deput: 
Speaker shall he ertitlod without payrent of ront to 
use of a furnishcd rusidonc c in Gangrt ok throughout the/y% 
terr of his offi ca and for a month aftor he ceases to 

hold such offico. 

Contd.. 3/ 



(2) Wher: any o: thc persons rentioned in sub-section (1), is 
not provide: with auy residence under subsecticn (1), he « 

shall bo pa.d an allow nce at th rat.e of »xkarxx four 

hundred rupecs por month so lonr as he is not providod with 
such rcsicer:e. 

(3) All expccit:re for raj ntonarco ind furnishing ff any 
residena pr'ovided under sub-section é1) shall be bornc y 
the Gov:rnTe:. 

(4) Every rber shall lbe crntitlod to such residntial accorr o 
atii 28 7y be prescribed at the placc of the sitting of 

' 

tho Asenbly durin: the 
(1) 

sssion or a reeti" of a Cor1ittee3. 
The nief Minis tor, the Mi nister, the i nistor of State, the 
Dep Speakor shail bc provided with frec vehicle and drirer 
an a.ll 0xrenses for the salaries and allowAne es of thc dri ver, cc of fuel, upto such lirit as may be prescrited, expenditurë o aintenance 

Convy ance 

and ropsirs of' the vehicles shall te korne y u Goveriont. 

(2) hore any of the 
not provided wi th the facilities of convey ance as spocified therein, he shall bc paid a conveyance allowance at the ratbe 
of four hundrcd rupers pur ronth and sliR1l in nddition te 
provided with a driver under the erplcynent of the Govornr ent. 

persons rentioned in sub-section (1) 1 

Every Member shatk le providod with a free non-transferable first class pass for travelling by Tailway fror and to any place in India for a distance of not excceding, fbve thbus end kiloretres in tho ar¢TeFato in any financial ycar and also a froe non-transíerakle pass for travellinz vithin the State of Sikkir by arry trans port servicc vehic le cwncd, controlled or Tanagcd ky the Govorn!rnt. 

F) 

Mcdical facili:ics (4) The Chief Mini ster, the Minister, the Minister of State, the the Deputy Mini ster, the Steaker, the Deputy Speaker and the 
rer bers alonr with thcir f>rrily 
mdical attendarice and treatr ont in ary of tho Governirent hospitalr of the State and nlso 
ties as may be prescribe:d. 

shall be entitled to free 

such other medi cal facili-

Travelli ikowance. 
(7. The Chief Minister, the Minister, the Minister.of State, the Deputy Minister, the Spcaker, the Deputy Spoaker and the men.bors shall be cntitled 

allowance whi le on tour on public business at such rates and subject to such conditions as nay be prescribed. 

to travelling 

. 

PoweT to rake rules 
3. Thc State Governr ent ray irake rules for carryin: out the p urposes of this Act anu, 

of the r atters rcquired to be prescribcd under any of the foregoin. provisions of this ict. 

in pArticular for any 

iepeal and savings .9.(i) II ill laws including rulos, rcfulations, orders, noti-fications, circulars o other provisions in respect of any matter governed by thie Act, rade or issued prior to the com encerent of this áct, shall cease and shall 
always bc deened to have ceased to have ary 
on and fror such conm encorent. 

f'orce or effect 

(2) Notwithstandina anythins contained in sub-section(1), all alnins under any of the pr ovisi ons ronti oned in sub-section (1) re latini. to the pariod prior to the conirence ment of this Act, and ron^inin: unpiid or unad justed the dat.e of the comrenc eirent of this Act shall bo phid or ndjusted, ns thce case 1y be under thc said provisions Act had not c orne into forde. 

on 

1sS 1f this 



(3) Ary ordor issuc, clairs paid, paynents nade or 

ary other acti.on taken before the comrencement of thi 
Ach in respect of sal-rios and allowanc es includin. 
advance pyment thereof nrá all other m1tters governedd 
by this Act shsll be deemed to have been validy 
iss:ied, paid, nade or taken duly and properly 

ud er proper Leal authority. 
ana 

SCli EDLE 

(Seeion 31i) and Seetion 3(21 

Designation Salary Sunptuary Allowanco 

1. Chief Minister Rs.2,250/- Rs.450/-
. Speaker Ns.2,000 its.300/ 
3. Minister Iis.1, 30/- i.225/-
4. Deputy Spenker s.1,600/-

5. Minister of State Ks.1,600/ Nil 

6. Deputy Minister Ks.1,200/- Ni1 

BY O DE OF THE GOVEINO 

B.l.Pradhan, 
SecretAry to the Government 

of Sik 

F 97/LL/77 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

EXTRA ORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

No. 44 Gangtok, Monday, April 3, 1978 

LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT 
NOTIFICATION 

No. 10/LL78 

Dated Gangtok, the 3rd April, 1978 

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of Government on the 
31s day of March, 1978 is hereby published for general information 

SIKKIM ACT NO. 10 OF 1978 
SIKKIM SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1978 

AN 
ACT 

To amend the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977; 
WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977, in the 

manner hereinafter appearing: 
Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Sikkim in the Twenty-ninth Year of the 

republic of India as follows: 

Short title 1. This Act may be called the Section 3 of Sikkim Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) 
Act, 1978 

Amendments 2. (1) In sub-section (3) of Section 3 of Sikkim Salaries and Allowance Act 1977, the words 
or a Committee" shall be and shall always be deemed to have been deleted. 

(2) Section 7 of Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977, shall be and shall always be 
deemed to have been numbered as sub-section (1) there of and after sub-section (1) so 
numbered the following shall be and shall always be deemed to have been added as 
sub-section (2), 

"(2) The embers shall be entitled to such traveling allowances and facilities at such 
rates and subject to such conditions as may be prescribed, for attending the meeting of a Committee" 

By Order of the Governor, 

B.R. PRADHAN, 
Secretary to the Government of Sikkim 

Law and Legislative Department 
F. 16 (11) LL/77 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

EXTRA ORD INARY 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORT Y 

No. 36 Gangtok, Friday, April 11, 1980 

LAW AND LEGISLATiVE DEPARTMENT 

NOTIFICATION 

No. 6/LL/80. 

Dated Gangtok, the 5th April, 1980. 

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of the Governor 
on the 5th day of April, 1980, is hereby published for general information. 

SIKKIM ACT NO. 6 OF 1980. 
THE SIKKIM SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1980. 

AN 
ACT 

further and the Sikkim salaries and Allowances Act, 1977 (4 of 1977). 
WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 

1977 (4 of l1977) in the manner hereinafter appearing: 
Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Thirty-first year of the 

Republic of India as follows:-

1 (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) 
Act, 1980. 

It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 25th day of October, 
1979. 

Short title and 
commencement 

(2) 

2. In the Sikkim Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977 (4 of 1977)- Amendment of 
section 1, Section 
3and Schedule. 

(a) in sub-section (1) of section 1, for the words "Sikkim 
Salaries and Allowances Act", the words "Sikkim Ministers, 

Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly 
(Salaries and Allowances) Act" shall be substituted. 

(6) in sub-section (2) of section 3 for the words "and the Speaker" 

the words" ",the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker" shall be subs 
tituted. 

in the Schedule for entry 4, the following shall be substituted: 
"4. Deputy Speaker Rs. 1,750/- Rs.225/-" 

c) 

By Order of the Governor, 

R. K. GUPTA, 
Secretary to the Government of Sikkim, 

Law & Legislative Department, 
Government of Sikkinm. 

F. No. 16(60)LL/78. 

PRINTED AT THE SIKKTM GOVERNMENT PRESS 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT 
GAZETTF 

EXTRAORDINARY 

PUBL'SHED BY AUTHORITY 

No. 77 Gangtok, Friday, September 19, 1980 

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENTT 

NOTIFICATION 

No. 9/LL/80. 

Dated Gangtok, the 18th September, 1980. 

The following Act of the Sikkim Legis lative Assembly having received the assent of 

the Governor on the 16th day of September, 1980, is hereby published for general information. 

SIKKIM ACT NO. 10 OF 1980 

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, 

AND MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 1980. 

DEPUTY SPEAKER 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Sikkin Ministers, Speaker, Deputy-Speaker and Mem-

bers of th: Legisle.ive Asscmbly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (4 of 

1977). 
Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Thirty-first year of 

the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy- Short title and 

Speaker and Members of the Legislative ASsembly (Salaries and commencement. 

Allowances) Amendment Act, 1980. 

(2) It shali be deemed to have come into force on the lst day of August, 

1980. 

In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy-Speaker and Members of Amendment of 

section 3 and s. 2. 
the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Aliowances) Act, 1977 

in sub-section (3) of scction 3 for the words "iwo hundred rupees" 
(a) 

the words "thrce hundred rupces" shall be substituted. 

(b) in sub-section (3) of section 5 for the words "five thousand kilo-

metres the words "eight 1housand kilometres" shall be substituted. 

By Order of the Ciovernor, 

B. R. PRADHAN, 
Sccrctary to the Government of Sikkim, 



SIKKIM 

GOVE RNMENT 
GAZ ETTE 

EXTRA ORD INAR Y 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

No.106 Gangtok Monday, September 15, 1986 

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 
LAW DEPARTMENT 

GANGTOK 

NOTIFICATION 
No. 10/LD/86 

Dated the 8th September, 1986. 

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of the Govenor on the 6th day of September, 1986 is hereby published for general information: 
THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 1986. 

(ACT NO. 10 OF 1986) 

AN 
ACT 

further amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. 

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Sikkim in the Thirty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows 

Short title and 
1.(1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allow commencements ances)Amendment Act, 1986. 

(2) It shall come into force on the lst day of September, 1986. 

In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinafter section 3. referred to as the 'said Act), in section 3, in sub-section (3),-

2. 
Amendment of 

(a) For the words "eight hundred rupees per month" the words "one thousand rupees per month", and 

(b) For the words "three hundred rupees per month" the words "live hundred rupees per month",shall be substituted. Shall be substituted. 



In the said Act, for the existing Schedule, the following Schedule shall be 
substituted, namely: 

3. 

"SCHEDULE 

sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 3 

Designation Salary Sumptuary Allowance 
SI. No. 

Rs. 700/-
Rs. 500/-

Rs. 3,800/ 

Rs, 3,500/-
Rs.3,000/ 
Rs. 3,000/ 
Rs. 2,500/-
Rs. 2,200/ 

Chief Minister 

Speaker 
Minister 

L. 

Rs..500/ 
Rs. 500/ 
Rs. 300/ 
Rs. 250/-

Deputy Speaker 
Minister of State 

4. 
5. 
6. Deputy Minister 

B.R.PRADHAN, 
Secretary to the Govt, of Sikkimn 

Law Department. 

(F.No.(11)LD/1977/86.) 

RPINTED AT THE SIKKIM GOVERNMENT PRESS GANGTOK. 



SIKKI M 

GOVERN MENT GA ZETTE 

EXTRA ORDINARY 
PUIBLISHD BY AUTHORrTY 

Gangtok, Tuesday, September 17, 1991 No. 144 

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 
LAW DEPARTMENT 

GANGTOK 

No. 8/D/1991 
Dated Gangtok, the 17th September, 1991. 

NOTIFICATION 
The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of the Governor on 17th day of September, 1991, is hereby published for general information:-

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT, ACT, 1991. 
(ACT NO. 5 OF 1991) 

A 
ACT 

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Sikkim in the Forty-second Year of the Republic of India as follows: 
1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and 

Allowances) Amendment Act, 1991. 
It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the lst 
day of July, 1991. 

(2) 

In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the 
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3 for sub-section (3;, the 
following sub-section shall be substituted, namely: 
(3) 

2 

There shall be paid to every member of the Assembly (a) a salary at the rate of one thousand rupees per month; 
(b) a consolidated allowance at the rate of five hundred rupees per month for his travelling and other expenses necessary for at-

tending the meetings of the Assembly; and 
(c) a constituency allowance of one thousand rupees per month." In the principal Act, after section 7, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:-

(1) Every Member shall be provided with a telephone at his residence if located within and around Gangtok for the term of his office and all expenses for initial deposit, installation, rental and official trunk call charges and local charges upto such limit as may be specified from time to time by the Government shall be borne by the Government. 

3. 

7A. 



2 

(2) In the case of a Member already having a telephone at his residence 
if located within and around Gangtok the rental and official trunk 
call charges and local charges upto such limit as may be specified from time to time by the Government shall be borne by the Govern-
ment for the term of his office". 

By Order of the Governor 

B.R. Pradhan, 
Secretary to the Government of Sikkim 

Law Department. 
(FNo. 16(11)/LD/1977/91) 

PRINTED AT THE SIKKIM GOVT. PRESS, GANGTOK 



SIKKIM1 

GAZETTE 
GOVERNMENT 

EXTRAORDINARY 

PUBLLSHED BY AUTHORITY 

Gangtok, Friday, 25th September, 1998 No. 215 

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 
LAW DEPARTMENT 

GANGTOK 

No.4/LD/98 Dated the 25th September, 1998 

NOTIFICATION 

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of the Governor on the 
20th day of September, 1998 is hereby published for general information: 

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER 

AND MEMBERS OF THE SIKKIM LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES 
AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 1998. 

(ACT NO.4 OF 1998-) 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker 
and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. 

BE it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Forty-ninth Yearof the Republic 
of India as follows: 

(1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy 
Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries 
and Allowances) Amendment Act, 1998. 

Short title and 
commenceme 

. 

(2) It shall come into force on the 1st day of April, 1998. 

2.In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly 
(Salaries and Allowances) Act, I977(hereinafler referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, in 
sub-section (3), 

) in clause (a), for the words "one thousand" the words "four thousand" 
shall be substituted; 
(ii) in clause (b), for the words "five hundred" the words "fifteen hundred" 
shall be substituted; and 



2 

3. In the principal Act, for the existing Schedule, the following 
Schedule shall be substituted namely: 

SCHEDULE 
(see sub-section (1) and (2) of section 3) 

SI. No. Designation Salary Sumptuary Allowance 

Chief Minister Rs. 9500/ Rs. 5000/ 

2 Speaker Rs.8500/ Rs. 4500/ 
3 Minister Rs. 7500 Rs. 4000/ 

Deputy Speaker Rs. 4000/ Rs. 7500 
Minister of State Rs. 3000/ Rs.6500/ 
Deputy Minister Rs. 5500/ Rs. 2500/ 

By order of the Governor. 

T.D. Rinzing, 

Legal Remembrancer and Secretary 
Law to the Govt. of Sikkim 
.F. No. 16(II)/LD/1977 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

(EXTRAORDINARY) 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Gangtok, Saturday 16" December 2000 No.4355 

LAW DEPARTMENT 
GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 

GANGTOK - 737101 

No. 19/LD Dated 16.12.2000 

NOTIFICATION 
The following act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly having received the assent of the 

Governor on 13" day of December, 2000 is hereby published for general information. 
THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF THE 
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2000 

(ACT. No. 19 OF 2000) 
AN 

ACT 
Further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speakers, deputy Speaker and Members of the 

Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances Act, 1977. 

Be it enacted byt the Legislature of Sikkim in the Fifty -first year of the Republic of India as 

follows: 
Short title and 1. (i) This aCt may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, deputy 

Commencement speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries and 
Allowances) Amendment Act, 2000. 

(i) It shall come into force at once. 

Amendment of 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speakers, Deputy Speaker and Members of 
the Legislative Assembly (salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977, in 
section 7A, sub- sectuib (1) and (2), the words "if located within and 
around Gangtok" shallbe omitted. 

section 7A 

By Order of the Governor, 

T.D.Rinzing 
Secretary to the Governemnt of Sikkim 

Law Department 

F.No. 16(82)/LD/2000 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Gangtok Monday, 12h October, 2001 No 411 

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 

LAW DEPARTMENT 

NO.09/LD/2001 dated 12h November.2001 

NOTIFICATION 

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislation Assembly having received the assent of the Governor on 5th day of 
November, 2001 is hereby published for general information: 

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 
(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2001 

ACT NO.9 OF 2001 
AN 

ACT 

Further to amend the Sikkim ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and members of the 

Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances )Act, 1977. 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Fifty-Second Year of the Republic of India as folloes: 

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers. Speaker, Deputy 
Commencement. Speaker and Members of the Legislative Assembly (Salaries 

and Allowances) 

(2) it Shall be deemed to have come into force on the I st day of April,2001 

Amendment of 2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of the 
Section 3. Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the 

principal Act), in Section 3, in sub-section (3), 

(i) in clause (a), for the words "four thousand", the word "eight thousand" shall be substituted: 

(iin clause(b), for the words "ifteen hunhred', the word "three thousand" shall be substituted; 
and 



(ii)in clause(c)for the words 'two thousand "the words four thousand shall be substituted. 
Amendment of schedule 3.In the principal Act for the existing schedule the following schedule shall be substituted 

namely:-

SCHEDULE 

(See sub-section(1)and (2)of section 3) 

SI. Designation Salary Sumptuary Allowance 
No 

Rs.19,000/ 
Rs.17,000/-
Rs.15,000/-
Rs.15,000/ 
Rs.13,000/-

Rs.11,000/ 

1. Chief Minister Rs.10,000/ 
Rs.9,000/ 

Rs.8,000/ 
Rs.8,000/-

Rs.6,000/-
Rs.5,000/ 

Speaker 
Minister 

2 
. 

Deputy Speaker 
Minister of State 
Deputy Minister 

4. 
5. 
6. 

BY Order, 

T.D.RINZING, 
Secretary to the Govt. of SIKKIM, 

Law Department. 

F.No.16(82)LD/2001. 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Wednesday 24th February, 2010 Gangtok No. 61 
GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 

LAW DEPARTMENT 
GANGTOK 

No. 11//LD/P/2010 Date: 24.2.2010 

NOTIFICATIiON 

THE SIKKIM MiNISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF SIKKIM 
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2009 

(ACT NO. 11 OF 2009) 
AN 

ACT 
further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Sikkim 

Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. 

Beit enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixtieth Year of the Republic of India as follows: 

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into foroe on the first day of June, Short titte and 
commencement. 2009. 

In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of 

Sikkim Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977, in 

section 4: 

2. 

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words "three thousand", the words "fourteen 

thousand five hundred" shall be substituted; 

(i) in sub-section (4), after the words "entitled to'" and before the word 

"such", the words "house rent allowance of rupees nine thousand 

four hundred per month or" shall be inserted. 

Amendment of 

section 4. 

By Order. 

R.K. PURKAYASTHA (SSJS) 
Legal Remembrancer-cum- Secretary 

Law Department 

File No. 16 (82)/LD/P/2010 

S.GP.G-61/Gazette/ 100 Cps/24.02.2010 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Gangtok Friday 26th March, 2010 No. No. 98 

LAW DEPARTMENT 
GOVERNMNET OF SIKKIM 

GANGTOK 
No.3/LD/P/2010 Dated: 25/03/2010. 

NOTIFICATION 

The following Act passed by the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received the assent 
of the Governor on 4th day of March, 2010 is hereby published for general information: 

THE SIKKIM MINISTERs, SPEAKER, DEPUTY sPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE 
ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2010 

(ACT NO. 3 OF 2010) 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative 

Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-first year of the Republic of India as 

follows: 
(1) 

Speaker and Members of Legislative Assembly (Salaries and 

Allowances) Amendment Act, 2010. 

Short title and 1. This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy 

commencement 

(2) It shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official 

Gazette. 

Amendment of In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of 2 
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinafter 
referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, in sub-section (3),-

section 3 

(1) in clause (a), for the words "eight thousand", the'words "ten 

thousand" shall be substituted; 

(i) in clause (b), for the words "three thousand", the words "fifteen 

thousand" shall be substituted 



in clause (c), for the words "four thousand", the words "fifteen 

thousand" shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 
Schedule 

In the principal Act, for the existing Schedule, the following Schedule 

shall be substituted, namely 
3. 

"SCHEDULE 
(See sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 3) 

Sumptuary Allowance SI Designation Salary 
No. 

Rs. 30,000/-
Rs. 25,000/ 
Rs. 20,000/ 
Rs. 20,000/-". 

Chiet Minister Rs. 50,000/ 
Rs. 45,000/ 
Rs. 40,000/-

Deputy Speaker Rs. 40,000/-

Speaker 
3. Minister 

R.K. Purkayastha, SsJS 
L.R.-cum-Secretary, Law 

Publication File No. 16 (82)/LD/2010 

s.G.P.G.-98/Gazette/ 100 Cps./26.03.2010 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

527 Gangtok 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 
Monday 27th September, 2010 No. 529 

LAW DEPARTMENT 
GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 

GANGTOK 9.2010 
No. 17/LD/P/2010 Dated: 25.09.2010 

NOTIFICATION rnoro on 
The following Act passed by the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received the assent of the 

Governor on 16h day of September, 2010 

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE 
ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2010. 

(ACT NO. 17 OF 2010) 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker: Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative Assembly 

Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. 
ndia as 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-first Year of the Republic of India as follows: 

ent 
Short title and 
Commencement 

(1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers of Legislative Assembly 
(Salaries and Allowances) Amendment Act, 2010. 

(2) lt shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official Gazette. 

1. 

as the 

gaming 
ial 

In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative 
Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977, in the Schedule, atter serial 
no. 4 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial no. and the entries 
shall be inserted, namely 

Amendment of 2. 

Schedule 

the 

"5 Minister of State Rs.35,000/- Rs.15,000/" 

R.K. Purkayastha, SsJS 

L.R-cum-Secretary, 
Law & Parllamentary Affalrs Department. 

File No. 16 (82) LD/P/2010 

73 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Monday 14th November, 2011 Gangtok No.591 
GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 

LAW DEPARTMENT 
GANGTODK 

No. 09/LD/2011 Date: 16/09/2011 

NOTIFICATION 

The following Act of the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received the assent of the Governor 
on the 3rd day of September, 2011 is hereby published for general information: 

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE 
ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCEs) AMENDMENT ACT, 2011. 

(Act No. 9 of 2011) 

An 

Act 

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative 
Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-second Year of the Republic of India as 

follows 
Short title 1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and 

Members of Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Amendment 
Act, 2011. 

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 27h day of September, 2010. 

and 
commencement 

2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative 
Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977, in the Schedule, after serial no. 5 
and the entries relating thereto, the following serial no. and the entries shall be 

inserted, namely 

Amendment 
of Schedule 

"6 Deputy Minister of State Rs. 33,000/- Rs.15, 000/-" 

By Order 

R.K. PURKAYASTHA (SSJS) 
LEGAL REMEMBRANCER-CUM-SECRETARY, 

LAW DEPARTMENT 
File No. 16 (82)/LD/2005 

S.G.P.G. - 591/ Gazette /30Nos./Dt:- 14.11.2011. 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTTE 

EXTRAORDINARY 

Gangtok 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 
Thursday 11h October, 2012 No.515 

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 
LAW DEPARTMENT 

GANGTOK 

No. 11/LD/P/2012 Dated: 08.10.2012. 

NOTIFICATION 

The following Act passed by the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received the assent 

of the Governor on 25h day of September, 2012 is hereby published for general information: 

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS 
OF LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) 

AMENDMENT ACT, 2012 (ACT NO. 11 OF 2012) 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of Legislative 

Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India as 

follows 

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker 
and Members of Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) 
Amendment Act, 2012. 

commencement 

(2) It shall coge into force on the date of its publication in the Official 
Gazette. 

2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of 
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 (hereinalter 
referred to as the principal Act), in clause (a) of sub-section (3) of section 
3, for the words "len thousand", the words "twenty five thousand" shall be 
substiuted. 

Amendment of 
section 3 



3. In the principal Act, for the existing Suledule, the tolto:wviwg Sohe sha 
be substituted, namely: 

Amendment 
of Schedule 

"SCHEDULE 
(See sub section (1) and (2) of suetion 3) 

SI. No. Designation Salaiy Sumptuc:yAllovance 
As. 50,000 
Rs. 45,000 
Rs. 0,00 
Rs. 40,000/ 
Rs. 35,000/ 

Chief Minister Rs. 45,u30/-1. 

Ms. ,w 
Hs. 36 10( 

Rs. 35,000 

Rs. 30,00Ur 

Speaker 
3. Minister 

Deputy Speaker 
Minister of State 

. Deputy Minister As. 33,000/- FHes. 90,CU", 

R.K Purkayastia (SsJS) 

L.R-cum-Secretary 
.Law Department. 

S.G.P.G. 615/ Gazette /30Nos./Dt: 11.10.2012 



SIKKIM 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Gangtok Thursday 14th June, 2018 No. 318 

GOVERNMENT OF SIKKIM 
LAW DEPARTMENT 

GANGTOK 

No. 07/LD/18 
Date: 14.06.2018 

NOTIFICATION 

The following Act passed by the Sikkim Legislative Assembly and having received assent of the Governor on 11th day of June, 2018 is hereby published for general information: 

THE SIKKIM MINISTERS, SPEAKER, DEPUTY SPEAKER AND MEMBERS OF 
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) AMENDMENT ACT, 2018 

(ACT NO. 07 OF 2018) 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of 
Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977. 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Sikkim in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India 

as follows: 

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy 
commencement Speaker and Members of Legislative Assembly (Salaries and 

Allowances) Amendment Act, 2018. 

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on 13 day of April, 
2018. 

2. In the Sikkim Ministers, Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Members of 

Legislative Assembly (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1977 
(hereinafter referred to as the "Principal Act", in section 3, in sub-
section (3), 

Amendment of 

Section 3 

(i) in clause (a), for the words "twenty tive thousand", the words 

"ninety thousand" shall be substituted; 

(6) 



(i) in clause (b) for the words "fifteen thousand", the words "thirty 

thousand" shall be substituted 

(i) in clause (c), for the words "fifteen thousand", the words "thirty 
thousand" shall be substituted. 

3. In the principal Act, for the existing Schedule, the following Schedule 

shall be substituted, namely: 
Amendment of 
Schedule 

"SCHEDULE 

(See sub-sectlon (1)) and (2) of section 3) 

SI. Designation Salary Sumptuary Allowance 

No. 

1 1. Rs. 1,60,000/ Rs. 1,10,000/ Chief Minister 

Speaker Rs. 1,40,000/ Rs 90,000/ 
2. 

Minister Rs. 1,20,000/- Rs. 80,000/ 
3 

Deputy Speaker Rs. 1,20,000/- Rs. 80,000/-
4. 

Minister of State Rs. 1,00,000/- Rs. 70,000/-

Rs. 95,000/- Rs 65,000/-" 
6. Deputy Minister of State 

Amendment of 4. In the Principal Act, in section 4, 

section 4 
() in sub-section (2), for the words "fourteen thousand five 

hundred", the words "eighteen thousand" shall be substituted; 

(i) in sub-section (4), for the words "nine thousand iour hundred", 

the words "thirteen thousand five hundred" shall be substituted 

and the words "during the session or a meeting of committee" 

appearing after the word "Assembly", shall be omitted. 

5. In the Principal Act, in section 5, in sub-section (1), for the words 

"the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker", the words "the Speaker, the 

Deputy Speaker and Members" shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 

section 5 

Jagat B. Ral (SSJS) 
L.R-cum-Secretary 

Law Secretary 

S.G.P.G.-318/ Com. 2/Gazette /100 Nos./ Dt:- 14.06.2018. 

62 



{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }

